FROM THE OFFICE OF
Jeff McMahan
STATE AUDITOR AND INSPECTOR

RESOLUTION FOR DISPOSING OF INVENTORY
# (D (Tt

S.A.& I 397 (2000)
Department Disposing of Inventory —B\g}n'\ c)c_!'ﬁF =

WHEREAS, in compliance with 19 OKL. St. Ann. § 339 and 19 Okl. St. Ann. § 421, the Board of
County Commissioners of Texas County, Oklahoma, are required, and have power to make all orders
respecting the property of the county, and to do and perform such other duties and acts as may be required
by law, and

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Texas County, Oklahoma, has under its
management and control one item of equipment described as follows:

A0 T\ing Mackine, S RAIR A0Sl

Nod Ravory T\
Foeltrracifrony Moer * | 122\9.01

Serial Number: _\D)\QR OO Ao Date Acquired: 12 ~Q8 -~ 2010

Name and address of who acquired: \ ;) axcen (:_oér

V0 B 312160 Aeaadi\\o —\ex05

Cost price when acquired: $§__ 11 Q1o 2119.00 Contract price if acquired under lease — rental
agreement: $ " Name and address of the person or firm to whom property

transferred Llarcen  Caol

Price received therefore: $ YN L\ODO LO0

AND, upon proper and careful consideration, find that the above equipment is obsolete, and not
economical to use in road repair, maintenance or construction, and that the use of said equipment would
require an expense that would not be justified for future use.

THEREFORE, after due consideration, and deeming it to be for the best interest of Texas County, the
Board of County Commissioners hereby orders the above described property —fv (sold, junked,
traded), and that the title to the same be transferred by the Chairman of the Board of County
Commissioners upon receipt of the above amount by the County Treasurer.

7N Passed and approved in regular session this _J¢«, day of a—‘&?'-w-i, 20 47

\_ BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
\ - TEXAS COUNTY, OKLAHOMA.
JATTEST:

7 Yattony
arcia [ ﬂ-‘(.t_a.g iy Chairm
/ County Clerk v N . s
ADQ w\w ) Member
By Q X
Member

Deputy

NOTE: 19 Okl St. Ann. § 421, requires that the above resolution or record be made within 30 days after the
Disposition of the Property and entered on the inventory record.



TEXAS COUNTY
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

TED KEELING RICHARD BRYAN JACK STRAIN
DISTRICT 1 DISTRICT 2 DISTRICT 3
P.O. Box 983 501 S. Main P.O. Box 773

Hooker, OK 73945 Guymon, OK 73942 Texhoma, OK 73949

(580) 652-2117 (580) 338-6336 (580) 423-7720

JULY 29,2013

TEXAS COUNTY OFFCIALS:

The purchase of the 2013 140M2 AWD
Caterpillar Grader on 5/28/13 was made in
conjunction with a trade-in. A 1996 JD Grader,
and a 2010 Milling Machine, which had not been
used since purchased. 1 spoke with Cheryl
Wilson and Sherri Meryl about how to handie
this matter. They both felt a trade-in included
with the bid was the best procedure instead of a
sale of the Milling Machine, and Grader there
was a surplus from the Milling Machine of
$128,316.10 which was paid by check from
Warren Cat, and placed in the District 2 Capital
Outlay Account.



The Cat Grader purchased on Trade-In was the
reason there was no Purchase Order put in
place. The 2013 Cat Grader acquired a unit
number of #307-238.

THANK YOU,

RICHARD BRYAN
COUNTY COMMISSIONER
TEXAS COUNTY DISTRICT 11



TEXAS COUNTY, Oklahoma

BID FORM
MOTOR GRADER
1.  MANUFACTURER:
MAKE AND MODEL:  Cat 140M AWD Sr#M9J720 $279,683.90

2. TRADE IN:Cat RM-300 Sr#¥BWR526 Deere 770BH Sr# 557824 $408,000.00

MAKE AND MODEL:
3. AMOUNT PAID TO BIDDER: $-128,316.10
4. GUARANTEED MAINTENANCE $ -0-

(From delivery to 5 years or 5,000 hours
whichever comes first)

5. SUBTOTAL (ITEM 3 PLUS ITEM 4) b -0-

6. GUARANTEED MINIMUM REPURCHASE
(From delivery to 5 years or 5000 hours $185,000.00
whichever comes first)

7. TOTAL COST BID (ITEM 5 LESS ITEM 6)

SYEAR/ 5,000 HOURS §-313,316.10

ACCEPTED FOR TEXAS COUNTY
DATE 7-A — /3

COMMISSIONER "7/@ _/éa_fﬂ
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SASI 14045 (1982) BID RECORD
Bld® 171213
Deopk: Disirict #2 Ulst fndividusl Btdders
REQ: MNew Motor Gradar
DATE:
Okiahama )

o Frontier Terrltory Asaociated Warren Gat
OPENS: May 28, 2013 Equipment Equinment Supply Co
Pape #1 1 2 3 4
Phona Number of Vendors $06-372-8388 806-33¢.1933
LIST INDWVIDUAL ITEMS: -
New All Wheel Drive Motot Grader No Bid Na Bid $290.000.00 279,683.90
Warranty 8 Year/5000 . No Bid No Bid No Yas
Trade In Catarpillar RM 300 Milling Machine 8/N
BWRO00628 No 8id Na Bid No Bld 380.600.03
Trade In John Deere 770 BH Motor Grader .
8IN 657824 Mo Bid No Bid No Bid 28,000.00
Gueranteed minimum Purchase No Bid No Bid No 8id 180.000.00
Total Cost Bid 280,000.00 -306,318.10




.WARREN

SALES AGREEMENT

DATE

WARREN CAT, PO 80X 50652, MIDLAND, TX 79711-0622 TEL. (432) 571-4200

Apx 18, 2013

PURCHASER TRXAS COUNTY 2
B STREETADDRESS 501 S MAIN ST <SRME>
s
o CITVISTATE oI, , 0K COUNTY "~ TEEAS (X70) H
1
D POSTAL CODE 73942-5541 PHOMENO. 580 338 6336 e S
T EOWPMENT DICXIE BERYAN T
0 CUSTOMER CONTACT: o
i PRODUCT SUPPORT DICKIE ERYAN
- FOBAT Amarillo -
INDUSTRY CODE: GOVT ROAD CORST & MAIRT(207R) PRINCIPAL WORK CODE

CUSTOMER 9993612

Sales Tax Exempfion # §f applicable)

GROSS TRADE ALLOWANCE
PAYOUTTO CFC

NUMBER TAX/EX GOVT/OK
. PAYMENT TERMS (An " 0 Finance C QAC sppe
E NET PAYMENT ONRECEIPTOF INVOICE [ NETONDELVERY [] lmm [Qcsc [Qiease
E CASH WITH ORDER $0.00 | BALANCE TO FINANCE CONTRACT INTEREST RATE
PAYMENT PERICD - PAYMENT AMOUNT NUMBER OF PAYMENTS OPTIONAL BUY-OUT
MAKE: CATERPTLIAR “MODEL: 140M2 AWD YEAR 2013
STOCKNUMBER: C55936 "' SERIAL NUMBER: TBA
140M2 ARD MOTOR GRADER 353-2924 |NO ACCGGRADE 362-5222 |Cat AM-PM Radio
140M2 AWD MOTOR GRADER 353-2924 |TIRES, 17.5R25 MX XITA 1* MP 252-0773 |Labor
LANE 2 ORDER 0P-9002 |GUARD GP, HITCH 323-6970 |Change the 17.5x25 tires and wheels
to. 14X24 bies tires
GLOBAL ARRANGEMENRT,LOW AMBIENT 363-3910 |LANGUAGE., ENGLISH 310-0725
MOLDBOARD, 14 FT, PLUS 349-3048 |ANTIFRERZE WINDSHIEID WASHER op-1939
RIPPER-SCARIFIER, REAR 324-0883 |COMFORT PACKAGE 291-3968
WEATHER, COLD AWD 353-3331 |LIGHTS, WORKING, PLUS 353-3320
LINES, STANDARD W/O ACCIMULATOR 305-2027 |CAMERA,HEAR VISIGN 391-2914
PRECLEBNER 356-8649 |MIRRORS, OUTSIDR MOUNTED 233-3295
THSTALLATION AR- BOX FRAME 362-6011 |GUAED, TRANSMISSION 366-2459
BASE & 2 (FL, RIP) 309-9851 |HEATER, ENGINE CDOLANT, 120V 249-5516
LIGHTS, FRONT NEADLIGHTS, HIGH 309-9881 |SHANKS/TEETH FOR SCARIFIER 4K-3330
STARTER, BLECTRIC, HEAVY DUTY 325-6336 |ROLL ON-ROLL OFF 0P-2265
CAB, PLUS {STANDARD GLASS) 389-7322 |Fromt Lift Group
CATERPILLAR PRODUCT LINK 321 373-6739 |Chrome mowboard
YEAR THADEi EQUIPMENT SERYAL NO. Sell Price $279,265.00
1996 | 7708BH - JOBN DEERE (JID) 557824 BExt Warranty Included
2011 |RM-300 - CATERPILLAR (AA) BHRS26 Less Gross Trade Allowance {$408, 000.00)
et Balance Due (§128,735.00)
AL TRADES 15 ARE SUBTECT TO EGUEMENT BEING M *AS INSPECTED CONDURON® BY VENDOR AT TME OF DELIVERY | HET: HET POTTER/RBNUAL {0.15%} $418.90
QF REPLACEMENT MACHINE PURCHASE ABOVE. After Tax Balamee ($128,316.10)

AMOUNT OWING $

WARREN CATTO PAY OUT ]

cl  that he hes vad 2 uvy of the Wm- CATICaterpiar Warsanly
wanmny. Schedalad ol {S0s8)s mmmawumamﬁm
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and hes sead ad understood said

New Machine (VAN} GOVY 5 Years / 5000 Hours PREMIER

CSA- <

[ wores:
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WARREN CAT
GRDER RECEIVED BY Jay ¥est

PURCHASER




s ¢« = PAYEE DETACH BEFORE DEPOSITING THIS CHECK . . . THIS COVERS PAYMENT IN FULL OF THE “~“LOWING . . . WARREN CAT

[ AS OF CHECK DATE VENDOR N. ..3ER
TEXAS COUNTY 2 ' 07.17.13 V000913 00431330
INVOICE DATE INVOICE NUMBER / DESCRIPTION | CREDIT / DEBIT DISCOUNT NET AMOUNT
07.09.13 | TRADE-IN CREDIT . 128316.10 - 0.00 128316.10
ToTALS:| 128316.10 128316.10

DETACH BEFORE DEPOSITING CREDITS / DEBITS DISCOUNTS AMOUNT PAID

WARNING: Qriginal document has True Fourdrinier Watermark, Invisible Void, and Printlock= Features

Warren (1 e sveceno. 00431330

64-1278/611

Warren CAT

P.Q. Box 60662, Midland, Texas 79711-0662 ) 07.17.13
Teiephons (432) §71-4200 -

AMOUNT
§ **%128,316.10

PAY one hundred and twenty eight thousand three hundred
and sixteen. DOLLARS and 10 CENTS

WARREN CAT
TOTHE TEXAS COUNTY 2 0
oroer | BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS &)0 v-&»v/
501 S MAIN ST
OF GUYMON, OK 73942-5541 ﬁﬁ 17’457/ /

EANL3ILIIMMme IENRLLILIAZAALS -NLINL1L193/A 3R




