

Wendy Johnson

COUNTY CLERK OF TEXAS COUNTY

319 North Main PO Box 197

GYMMON, OK, 73942

DEPUTIES
Kelly Voorheis
Peggy Padilla

(580)338-3141

Cathy Byers

(580) 338-4311 fax

Erin Tyson

DEPUTIES

Debbie Tyson

Alisha Perez

Deidre Sommers

Brittaney Voorheis

February 20, 2018

Dear Bidders:

Thank you for your bid #7-17-18 Rock, for Texas County District #1, 2 and 3. The bid was awarded to whichever is most advantageous to the District.

As always, thank you for your bid and we hope you will bid again.

Sincerely,

Kelly Voorheis
Deputy County Clerk

BID RECORD

Bid # 7-17-18

List Individual Bidders

Dept:	District #1, #2, #3							
REQ:	Rock							
DATE:	March 13, 2018 thru March 13, 2019							
OPENS:	February 20, 2018							
Page #1	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8
Phone Number of Vendors	806-249-8743	806-273-7501	620-624-8439	405-297-8225				
	At Plant / Delivered	At Plant / Delivered	At Plant / Delivered					
Type B Grade 4 Washed Gravel:								
Unspecified Amount District 1 Hooker Shop	18.00 / 41.31	32.00 / No Bid	18.00 / 25.00	10.85 / No Bid				
Unspecified District 2 Guymon Optima	18.00 / 39.46	32.00 /	18.00 / 27.50	10.85 /				
Unspecified Amount District 2 Guymon	18.00 / 38.53	32.00 /	18.00 / 31.00	10.85 /				
Unspecified Amount District 3 Texhoma Shop	18.00 / 33.91	32.00 /	18.00 / 35.00	10.85 /				
Type A Grade 5 Washed Patching Rock:								
Hooker	18.00 / 41.31	32.00 /	18.00 / 25.00	10.85 / No Bid				
Guymon	18.00 / 39.46	32.00 /	18.00 / 31.00	10.85 /				
Texhoma	18.00 / 33.91	32.00 /	18.00 / 35.00	10.85 /				
1/2" - 3/4" Washed Rock:								
Hooker	18.00 / 41.31	No Bid	No Bid	11.05 / No Bid				
Guymon	18.00 / 49.46			11.05 /				
Texhoma	18.00 / 33.91			11.05 /				