

WENDY JOHNSON  
COUNTY CLERK OF TEXAS COUNTY  
319 North Main, Suite 204, PO Box 197  
GUYMON, OK 73942  
(580)338-3141  
(580) 338-4311 fax

DEPUTIES  
Kelly Voorheis  
Peggy Padilla  
Cathy Byers  
Isabel Ochoa

DEPUTIES  
Alisha Perez  
Brittaney Voorheis  
Deidre Sommers

March 29, 2021

Dear Bidders:

Thank you for your bid #9-20-21, Oil and Asphalt, for Texas County District #1, 2 and 3.  
The award goes to the lowest bidders.

As always, thank you for your bid and we hope you will bid again.

Sincerely,

Kelly Voorheis  
Deputy County Clerk,  
Texas County

Bid # 9-20-21

Dept:	District #1,2,3
REQ:	Oil and Asphalt
DATE:	March 29, 2021 thru September 29, 2021
OPENS:	March 29, 2021
TIME:	11:00: AM
Page #1	

Vance Brothers Inc	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Inc	Coastal Energy Corp	Wright Asphalt Product Co	Asphalt & Fuel Supply LLC	Logan County Asphalt Co	Ja R Sand Co Inc.	Crafco Inc
1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8

Phone Number of Vendors		1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8
Proline	FOB at Plant	816-923-4325	405-595-9073	417-469-2777	417-343-7848	918-488-1339	405-282-3711	620-624-8439	602-276-0400
	FOB District #1						99.75		
	FOB District #2						129.00		
	FOB District #3						129.00		
Proline Bags 50#	FOB at Plant						9.50		
	FOB District #1						11.50		
	FOB District #2						11.50		
	FOB District #3						11.50		
35#	FOB at Plant								
	FOB District #1								
	FOB District #2								
	FOB District #3								
Hot Mix/Cold Lay	FOB at Plant								
	FOB District #1								
	FOB District #2								
	FOB District #3								
Type B-Hot Mix/Hot Lay	FOB at Plant							90.00	
	FOB District #1								
	FOB District #2								
	FOB District #3								
SS-1 (tack coat)	FOB at Plant								
	FOB District #1				2.17				
	FOB District #2				2.17				
	FOB District #3				2.17				
SS-1 (tack coat)	FOB at Plant	1.95	1.95					450	
	FOB District #1	2.20	2.09	2.14				with hot mix	
	FOB District #2	2.20	2.09	2.14					
	FOB District #3	2.20	2.09	2.14					

No Bid

Bid # 9-20-21

Dept:	District #1,2,3								
REQ:	Oil and Asphalt								
DATE:	March 29, 2021 thru September 29, 2021	Vance Brothers	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Inc	Coastal Energy Corp	Wright Asphalt Product Co	Asphalt & Fuel Supply LLC	Logan County Asphalt Co	Ja R Sand Co Inc	Crafco Inc
OPENS:	March 29, 2021	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8
TIME:	11:00: AM								
Page #2									
<b>Phone Number of Vendors</b>									
<b>SS-1H (slurry seal)</b>	FOB at Plant								
	FOB District #1								
	FOB District #2								
	FOB District #3								
<b>CRS-2 (chipping coat)</b>	FOB at Plant	1.85	1.84						
	FOB District #1	2.10	1.88	2.08	2.01				
	FOB District #2	2.10	1.88	2.08	2.01				
	FOB District #3	2.10	1.88	2.08	2.01				
<b>CRS-2-S</b>	FOB at Plant	2.10	2.10						
	FOB District #1	2.35	2.14	2.32	2.16				
	FOB District #2	2.35	2.14	2.32	2.16				
	FOB District #3	2.35	2.14	2.32	2.16				
<b>Asphalt Emulsion</b>	FOB at Plant	2.36	2.40						
<b>Prime oil</b>	FOB District #1	2.55	2.54	2.49					
	FOB District #2	2.55	2.54	2.49					
	FOB District #3	2.55	2.54	2.49					
<b>Cold pour Crack Sealer w/Rubber Asphalt</b>	FOB at Plant								
	FOB District #1								
	FOB District #2								
	FOB District #3								
<b>MS-2 or CMS-1(mixing grades)</b>	FOB at Plant		2.40						
	FOB District #1		2.54						
	FOB District #2		2.54						
	FOB District #3		2.54						
<b>MC-250 Cutback Asphalt</b>	FOB at Plant			2.24		2.20			
	FOB District #1			2.34		2.25			
	FOB District #2			2.34		2.25			
	FOB District #3			2.34		2.25			
<b>CRS-TR</b>	FOB District #1				2.06				
	FOB District #2				2.06				
	FOB District #3				2.06				

No Bid

Bid # 9-20-21

Dept:	District #1,2,3								
REQ:	Oil and Asphalt								
DATE:	March 29,2021 to September-29,2021								
OPENS:	March 29,2021 to September-29,2021	Vance Brothers Inc	Ergon Asphalt Emulsions Inc.	Coastal Energy Corp	Wright Asphalt Products Co	Asphalt + Fuel Supply LLC	Logan County Asphalt Co	Ja R Sand Co Inc	Crafo Inc
TIME:	11:00:AM								
Page #3		1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8
Phone Number of Vendors									
MC-800 Cutback Asphalt	FOB at Plant			2.19		2.15			
	FOB District #1			2.29		2.26			
	FOB District #2			2.29		2.26			
	FOB District #3			2.29.		2.20			
MC-3000 Cutback Asphalt	FOB at Plant			2.14		2.14			
	FOB District #1			2.24		2.19			
	FOB District #2			2.24		2.19			
	FOB District #3			2.24		2.19			
MC-30 Cutback Asphalt	FOB at Plant			2.39		2.23			
	FOB District #1			2.49		2.35			
	FOB District #2			2.49		2.35			
	FOB District #3			2.49.		2.35			
MC-70 Cutback Asphalt	FOB at Plant			2.35		2.22			
	FOB District #1			2.45		2.33			
	FOB District #2			2.45		2.33			
	FOB District #3			2.45		2.33			
AC102-TR	FOB at Plant								
	FOB District #1								
	FOB District #2								
	FOB District #3								
FastSet Asphalt Emulsion (Fog Seal)	FOB at Plant								
	FOB District #1		1.99.						
	FOB District #2		1.99						
	FOB District #3		1.99						
Pump Charge	FOB at Plant	75.00	70.00	75.00	75.00	75.00			
	FOB District #1								
	FOB District #2								
	FOB District #3								
Jemurrage Charge	FOB at Plant	76.00	70.00	75.00	75.00	75.00			
	FOB District #1								
	FOB District #2								

AFTER 2 hrs. AFTER 2 hrs. AFTER 2 hrs. AFTER 2 hrs. AFTER 2 hrs.

No Bid

Bid # 9-20-21

Dept:	District #1,2,3								
REQ:	Oil and Asphalt								
DATE:	March 29, 2021 - September 29, 2021	Vance Brothers Inc.	Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Inc.	Coastal Energy Corp	Wright Asphalt Products Co	Asphalt & Fuel Supply LLC	Logan County Asphalt Co	Ja R Sand Co Inc	Crafco Inc
OPENS:	March 29, 2021								
TIME:	11:00:AM								
Page #3		1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8
	FOB District #3								
CQS - 1F	FOB at Plant	1.90							
	FOB District #1	2.15	1.99	2.05					
	FOB District #2	2.15	1.99	2.05					
	FOB District #3	2.15	1.99	2.05					

\$775.00 for  
Short Freight  
less than  
5,500 gal.

No Bid